
 

 

31ST MARCH 2023 

  

LAWLEY PRIMARY SCHOOL 
PLANTING THE SEEDS, GROWING THE FUTURE 

 

 

DATE EVENT 

17th April  Return to school 

24th / 25th  April Rescheduled Y1 Parent's 
Evening 

4th May Class Photographs 

9th May SATs Week Y6 

17th May Y6 John Muir—Stiperstones 

25th May EYFS Wedding 

5th June Y6 John Muir—Clee Liberty 

15th June Reception Trip to Wonderland 

19th—23rd June Y6 Stoles Barn Residential 

28th—29th June Y3 Wilderhope Residential 

3rd July EYFS Sports Day 

4th July Y1 & Y2 Sports Day 

5th July Y3 & Y4 Sports Day 

6th July Y5 & Y6 Sports Day 

12th  -14th  July Y4 Long Mountain Residential  

21st July End of Term 

Please can we ask that parents  do not use the 

staff car park at any time. There have been a 

number of near misses when our staff are ar-

riving in school and entering the car park.   

Parents/carers/guardians are responsible for 

their children until handed over at the class-

room doors. 

What a fantastic term we have had in school. The 
children had a wonderful time on Wednesday during 
the skipping workshops and it was great to see 
them challenging themselves to beat their own 
scores. The teachers also got to have a go, with Mr 
Scott winning the competition and Mrs McQuiggin 
coming a close second! 

We were treated to some fantastic music from our 
rock bands during the Rock Steady concerts, it’s 
lovely to see how well the children are progressing 
and watching them gain confidence through their 
music.  

Our year 3/4 boys have reached the football finals 
and will be playing at the Bucks Head on Thursday 
4th May, kickoff at 5.45pm. We would love to see as 
many parents there as possible to cheer our team 
on. Further details will be sent out nearer the time.  

We have some exciting residential visits coming up 
for years 3, 4 and 6. If you have not yet signed up 
for these and would still like your child to attend, 
please can you visit ParentPay to give consent.  

It was lovely to see so many parents attending the 
speech and language coffee morning this week. If 
you are interested in attending further sessions 
please contact the school.  

We hope you have a safe and relaxing Easter break 
and we will look forward to seeing  you on Monday 
17th April. 

 

ParentPay Accounts 

Please can we ask that all 

ParentPay accounts are 

kept in credit. Lunches 

should be paid for in ad-

vance and all Breakfast 

Club and Afterschool Club 

sessions should be booked 

and paid for in advance 

too. Thank  you. 

Attendance Matters 

Please can we ask that you call the 

School Office if your child is poor-

ly. There is an answerphone facility 

if you call outside of school hours.  

If your child is late please bring 

them to the main reception where 

you will be asked to sign them in.  



 

 

BREAKFAST  & AFTERSCHOOL CLUB 

Our Breakfast and Afterschool Club Team 

have had a busy half term relaunching the 

club menus. The children have been fully in-

volved in deciding what should be on the 

menu and have enjoyed trying new foods.   

After Easter we will be sending out a short 

survey to parents for feedback on the new 

changes. We would love to hear your 

thoughts.  

If you have any toys or games that your child 

has outgrown we would love to be able to 

give them a new home! Any donations can be 

brought to the School Office.  

If you would like to sign your child up to at-

tend either of the clubs please contact the of-

fice for the admission forms.  

Breakfast Club—£2.50 per session 

Afterschool Club—£8.00 per session / £5 per 

sibling.  

We are hoping to be able to get outside as 

much as possible when the weather starts to 

warm up. Collection will then be from the 

main school gates.  


